
 

Participants as of 14 March  

 

First 
Name Last Name Title 

Company 
Name Company Website Country Company Description  Type 

Christia
n Hernandez Partner 2150 www.2150.vc 

United 
Kingdom 

2150 invests in 
technologies that help to 
make our built world 
more efficient resilient 
and sustainable. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Taku 
Matsumot
o Principal 

Acario/Toky
o Gas https://acarioinnovation.com/ USA 

Acario is Corporate 
Venture Capital and Open 
Innovation arm of Tokyo 
Gas.Tokyo Gas pledged to 
be a "carbon zero" utility 
by 2050 utilizing 
innovative technology 
and business model 
partnering with startups 
globally. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Sabrina 
Maria Malpede 

Managing 
Director 

ACT Blade 
Ltd actblade.com 

United 
Kingdom 

ACT Blade develops the 
lightest only modulare 
wind turbine blade for a 
NET-ZERO future. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Flavien 
Deguilhau
me 

Project 
Advisor - 
Cleantech & 
Green 
Building Aderly https://www.aderly.fr/en/ France 

Aderly covers all the 
stages of business 
development or start-up 
projects in the Lyon 
region. It supports all 
types of businesses, from 
SMEs to major 
corporations, in all the 
sectors of activity.The 
Agency offers a range of 
services funded by its 
members and tailored to 
individual companies’ 
needs. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Adrien CATTIN 
Project 
Advisor 

Aderly - 
Invest In 
Lyon https://www.aderly.fr/en/ France 

Aderly covers all the 
stages of business 
development or start-up 
projects in the Lyon 
region. It supports all 
types of businesses, from 
SMEs to major 
corporations, in all the 
sectors of activity. The 
Agency offers a range of 
services funded by its 
members and tailored to 
individual companies’ 
needs. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Dean 
Mulqueen
y Executive AECI www.aeciworld.com 

South 
Africa 

AECI is a diversified 
chemicals manufacturer 
and distributor with 
interests in mining water 
agri and plant health 
food & beverage 
additives and chemicals 
(industrial specialty). 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 



kotaro KODAMA 

Senior 
Manager of 
Open 
Innovation AGC Inc https://www.agc.com/en/ Japan 

I'm in charge of Open 
Innovation with 
European 
companies(including 
start-ups). Our global 
open innovation towards 
a sustainable industry 
needs your cutting-edge 
technology. 
Decarbonization, CCUS, 
Energy, Batteries, 
Bioscience, Electronics, 
etc. My technical 
background is in 
electrical engineering an 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Martijn Schouten 
International 
Advisor 

Alacrity 
Canada https://alacritycanada.com/cleantech/ 

Netherla
nds 

Alacrity Canada is a non-
profit organization driven 
by its mission to support 
entrepreneurship. The 
Alacrity Cleantech 
program is one of the 
organization's foremost 
programs, and seeks to 
support cleantech 
companies with 
international sales and 
growth. 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Sofie Campbell 
Marketing 
Specialist 

Alacrity 
Canada https://alacritycanada.com/cleantech/ Canada 

Alacrity Canada is a non-
profit organization driven 
by its mission to support 
entrepreneurship. The 
Alacrity Cleantech 
program is one of the 
organization's foremost 
programs and seeks to 
support cleantech 
companies with 

Non-profit / 
NGO 



international sales and 
growth. 

Adam Chirkowski 
Investment 
Director 

Albion 
Capital 
Group LLP https://www.albion.capital/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Albion Capital Group LLP 
is a leading independent 
investment manager with 
a long-term record of 
backing change and 
growth. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Meryem Cherif 
Investment 
manager AP Ventures apventures.com 

United 
Kingdom 

AP Ventures is a venture 
capital firm 
headquartered in London 
focused in supporting 
hydrogen technology 
companies 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Courtne
y Brennan Associate Ara Partners https://www.arapartners.com/ Ireland 

Global private equity in 
decarbonzation. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Robert Bond Associate Ara Partners https://www.arapartners.com/ USA 
Global private equity in 
decarbonization. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Adam Hodgson Associate Ara Partners https://www.arapartners.com/ USA 
Global private equity in 
decarbonization. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Abhiram Karuppur Associate Ara Partners https://www.arapartners.com/ USA 
Global private equity in 
decarbonization. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Helen Lin Principal 
At One 
Ventures www.atoneventures.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At One Ventures is a 
Silicon Valley-based 
venture capital firm 
investing in a world 
where humanity is a net 
positive to nature. We 
seek innovative 
technologies that can 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



upend the traditional 
industries contributing to 
climate change.  Our 
focus is seed and Series A 
stage companies globally. 

Vilas Kuchinad 

Sustainable 
Finance - 
Innovation 

Bank of 
America  USA 

Driving Bank of America's 
entry into new clean 
energy and sustainable 
infrastructure asset 
classes including: Carbon 
Removals, Hydrogen, 
Sustainable Aviation 
Fuels, Waste-to-Energy, 
Water Infrastructure, 
Sustainable 
Agriculture/Aquaculture, 
and Mobility 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Ulrich Seitz 
Managing 
director 

BayWa r.e. 
Energy 
Ventures https://energy-ventures.baywa-re.com/ Germany 

We are a venture capital 
firm investing in energy 
tech across Europe and 
Israel. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Grigoriy 
(Greg) Zavorotniy 

Senior 
investment 
manager 

BayWa r.e. 
Energy 
Ventures https://energy-ventures.baywa-re.com/ Germany 

We are a venture capital 
firm investing in energy 
tech across Europe and 
Israel. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Olga Jensen Associate 

BayWa r.e. 
Energy 
Ventures https://energy-ventures.baywa-re.com/ Germany 

We are a venture capital 
firm investing in energy 
tech across Europe and 
Israel. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Nuzhat Fatima 

Senior 
engagement 
adviser BEIS  

United 
Kingdom 

Working as a Senior 
Engagement and Briefing 
Advisor in Science and 
Innovation for Climate 
and Energy (SICE) 
directorate- delivering UK 
Government's £1 billion 
Net Zero Innovation 

Governmen
t 



Portfolio which aims to 
accelerate the 
commercialisation of 
innovative clean energy 
technologies and 
processes. 

teresa O'flynn 
Managing 
Director Blackrock Blackrock.com Ireland 

Blackrock Alternative 
Investors 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Oz Razak 

Strategy & 
Innovation 
Consultant 

Blackslope 
Consulting www.blackslope.co.za 

South 
Africa 

Blackslope Consulting 
assists large 
Johannesburg Stock 
Exchange listed entities 
with strategic business 
growth. We identify key 
future-focused market 
trends as well as suitable 
entities for investment/ 
strategic partnerships 
etc. primarily in the 
clean-tech domain. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Paul Plummer 
Managing 
Director 

Blackslope 
Consulting www.blackslope.co.za 

South 
Africa 

Blackslope Consulting 
assists large 
Johannesburg Stock 
Exchange listed entities 
with strategic business 
growth. We identify key 
future-focused market 
trends as well as suitable 
entities for investment/ 
strategic partnerships 
etc. primarily in the 
clean-tech domain. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



Gerard Ungerer 

Strategy & 
Innovation 
Lead 

Blackslope 
Consulting www.blackslope.co.za 

South 
Africa 

Blackslope Consulting 
assists large 
Johannesburg Stock 
Exchange listed entities 
with strategic business 
growth. We identify key 
future-focused market 
trends as well as suitable 
entities for investment/ 
strategic partnerships 
etc. primarily in the 
clean-tech domain. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Carmen Ene CEO 
BNP Paribas 
3 Step IT https://www.3stepit.com/ Finland 

We take care of the 
world's technology by 
helping organisations 
manage their IT in a 
sustainable and efficient 
way. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

PASCAL
E FAVRE 

Managing 
Director of 
the 
Technology 
& Lifecycle 
Solutions 
(TLS) 
International 
Business 
Line 

BNP 
PARIBAS 
LEASING 
SOLUTIONS https://leasingsolutions.bnpparibas.fr/ France 

We help companies to 
develop their activity 
sustainably with rental 
and financing solutions as 
well as services adapted 
to their needs. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

yann lagalaye 
managing 
partner bnpparibas  France 

BNP Paribas Ecological 
Transition and Impact 
team including a €150-
200m venture capital 
fund BNPP Solar Impulse 
venture fund open to 3rd 
party investor, a €100m 
historical ETC investment 
line (Ecological Transition 
venture line) and a Investor 



€155m Impact line 
(Natural Capital, Local 
dev, Social) 

Miriam Eaves 
Head of 
Origination 

BP 
Launchpad 

https://www.bp.com/en/global/corporate/what-we-
do/technology-at-bp/bp-launchpad.html 

United 
Kingdom 

BP’s Private equity 
investor/ business builder 
investing in digitally lead 
startups. to enable BP’s 
energy transition 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Toby Knight 
Investment 
Associate 

bp 
Launchpad https://www.itslaunchpad.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

bp's investment platform 
for scaling a progressive 
portfolio of digitally-led 
businesses which re-
imagine energy. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Cathal Hughes 
Investment 
Associate 

BP 
Launchpad https://bplaunchpad.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Our vision is to generate 
sustainable change by 
building and scaling a 
progressive portfolio of 
digitally-led businesses 
which re-imagine energy 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Ella King 
Innovation 
Engine Lead bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 
growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Emma Boon 
Investment 
Associate bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 
growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Erin Hallock 
Managing 
Partner bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 
growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Nick Kendall 
Investment 
Associate bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Ignacio 
(Nacho) Gimenez 

Managing 
Partner bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 
growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Johnath
an Stone Principal bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 
growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Sophia Nadur 
Managing 
Partner bp ventures https://www.bp.com/en/global/bp-ventures 

United 
Kingdom 

bp ventures is a 
corporate venture capital 
investor that is helping 
bp to reinvent itself as an 
integrated energy 
company in line with bp's 
new purpose: 
reimagining energy for 
people and planet. bp 
ventures invests in high 
growth tech businesses 
that will benefit and 
extend our core 
businesses. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Nicolas Bosse 

Chief Energy 
Transition 
Officer BrainBox AI www.brainboxai.com Canada 

BrainBox AI 
autonomously optimize 
buildings’ energy 
consumption creating 
thermal battery providing 
energy flexibility required 
to support a reliable and 
resilient energy 
transition. Our 
innovations enable cost-
effective solutions to 
challenges posed by the 
electrification of 
economies. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Roald Koch 
Senior 
Manager 

Brandenburg 
Economic 
Developmen
t Agency 
(WFBB) wfbb.de/en Germany 

The Economic 
Development Agency 
Brandenburg (WFBB) is 
the central point of 
contact for investors, 
companies based in 
Brandenburg and 
technology-oriented 
start-ups. WFBB offers a 
broad array of services 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 



for economic 
development and among 
others the Brandenburg 
Energy Agency and 
innovation clusters. 

ERIC DUSSEUX ADVISOR 

BREAKTHRO
UGH 
ENERGY 
VENTURES https://www.breakthroughenergy.org/ France 

The aim of Breakthrough 
Energy Ventures is to 
accelerate an energy 
transition across every 
sector of the economy. 
We invest in visionary 
entrepreneurs, building 
companies that can have 
a significant impact on 
climate change at scale. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Olivier Thirifays 
Co-founder 
and partner BXVentures www.bxventures.com Belgium 

BXVentures is the first 
global Venture Studio 
dedicated to Cleantech 
investments.BXVentures' 
mission is to build 
Cleantech Assets for 
Tomorrow. To this end, 
the objective is to 
identify, shape & venture 
cleantech assets that 
secure the long-term 
viability of our biosphere 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Alexand
er Lidgren Founder byNordic www.bynordic.se Sweden 

A Special Purpose 
Acquisition Company 
listed on Nasdaq New 
York, raised USD 
$172,500,000  aiming to 
merge with a high growth 
European tech company. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Pieter Bouwer 

Regional 
Trade 
Commission
er, Cleantech 
(Europe) 

Canadian 
Embassy 
Berlin www.tradecommissioner.gc.ca Germany 

Helping Canadian 
Cleantech companies to 
find opportunities in 
Europe. Working with 
European companies to 
scout for Canadian 
Cleantech solutions. 

Governmen
t 

Rob 
van der 
Meij Partner 

Capricorn 
Partners www.capricorn.be Belgium 

Capricorn Partners wants 
to create both financial 
return and strategic value 
for its clients by investing 
in innovative companies 
that have a positive 
impact on people and the 
planet. We offer a unique 
mix of technology and 
investment expertise, 
creating an ecosystem of 
capital and 
entrepreneurship. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Laura Gillions 

Director of 
Marketing & 
Communicat
ions 

Carbon 
Clean https://www.carbonclean.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Carbon Clean is a global 
leader in carbon capture 
solutions for hard-to-
abate industries such as 
cement, steel, refineries 
and energy from waste. 
The company’s patented 
technology significantly 
reduces the costs of 
carbon capture when 
compared to existing 
solutions. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Robert Olrog 
Senior 
Analyst 

Carbon 
Limiting 
Technologies www.carbonlimitingtechnologies.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Carbon Limiting 
Technologies (CLT) works 
with early stage 
companies, corporates, 
investors, and 
governments to support 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



and grow businesses 
developing climate tech 
innovations and with 
businesses and local 
authorities seeking to 
decarbonise their 
operations and regions. 

David Aitken 
Director, 
Innovation Carbon Trust www.carbontrust.com 

United 
Kingdom 

The Carbon Trust is an 
expert partner for 
businesses, governments 
and organisations around 
the world – helping them 
decarbonise and 
accelerate to Net Zero 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Mark Simmers CEO 

Celtic 
Renewables 
Limited www.celtic-renewables.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Celtic Renewables is 
commercialising a 
patented process which 
converts unwanted 
wastes and residues into 
carbon-negative solvents 
and other products which 
directly displace fossil-
fuel equivalents. These 
solvents are used to 
make products or in 
processes which are 
omnipresent in our 
everyday lives. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Claire Treacy 

Chief 
Financial 
Officer 

Celtic 
Renewables 
Ltd www.celtic-renewables.com 

United 
Kingdom 

World first bio-refining 
business using waste and 
food and drink by-
products to produce bio-
based solvents (butanol 
acetone and ethanol) for 
customers looking to 
transition products and 
manufacturing processes 
to net zero. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Fred 
van 
Beuningen 

Managing 
Partner 

Chrysalix 
Venture 
Capital www.chrysalix.com 

Netherla
nds 

Global venture capital 
firm with focus on 
industrial resource 
productivity and climate 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

David Mowat Partner 
Circularity 
Capital LLP www.circularitycapital.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Founder partner at the 
specialist private equity 
fund manager with a 
focus on investing in 
European SMEs operating 
within the circular 
economy. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Samuel Hill 
Investment 
Analyst 

Clean 
Growth Fund www.cleangrowthfund.com 

United 
Kingdom 

CGF invests in Seed and 
Series A low carbon 
companies that are based 
in the UK and have the 
potential to deliver 
significant commercial 
returns and can 
demonstrate strong 
greenhouse gas 
abatement. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Stephen Price 
Investment 
Director 

Clean 
Growth Fund www.cleangrowthfund.com 

United 
Kingdom 

CGF invests in early stage 
UK based cleantech 
companies with strong 
product market fit across 
power buildings industry 
transport and waste. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Susanna
h 

McClintoc
k 

Investment 
Director 

Clean 
Growth Fund www.cleangrowthfund.com 

United 
Kingdom 

CGF is a venture capital 
investor that focusses on 
Seed and Series A 
investments in power 
buildings industry 
transport and waste. 
Companies need to be UK 
based and show strong 
product market fit. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Connor Duffy 
Investment 
Associate 

Clean 
Growth Fund www.cleangrowthfund.com 

United 
Kingdom 

CGF invests in UK based 
Seed and Series A 
companies that can 
demonstrate attractive 
commercial returns and a 
strong greenhouse gas 
emissions reduction 
potential 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Beverle
y 

Gower-
Jones 

Managing 
Partner 

Clean 
Growth Fund www.cleangrowthfund.com 

United 
Kingdom 

CGF invests in UK based 
cleantech companies 
with product market fit 
across power buildings 
industry transport and 
waste 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Ben Lynch 
Managing 
Partner 

CleanTech 
Capital 
Advisors https://www.cleantechcapitaladvisors.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

CleanTech Capital 
Advisors (CCA) is a 
pioneering corporate 
finance advisory firm, 
providing transaction 
advisory services for 
companies in the 
CleanTech sector. Since 
2012 we have advised 
many of the most 
disruptive European 
cleantech startups. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Sofia Karagianni 
Policy 
Analyst 

Cleantech 
for Europe  Belgium STAFF 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Nicole Cerulli 
research 
analyst 

cleantech 
group  Spain 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Lucy Chatburn 
Consultant 
Manager 

Cleantech 
Group  Italy 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Holly Stower 

Lead 
Analyst, 
Resources 
and 
Environment 

Cleantech 
Group  

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



Richard Youngman CEO 
Cleantech 
Group www.cleantech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Ian Hayton 

Lead 
Analyst, 
Materials 
and 
Chemicals 
Research 

Cleantech 
Group https://www.cleantech.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Jules Besnainou Director 
Cleantech 
Group www.cleantech.com France 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

laura dolby 

Senior 
Marketing 
Manager 

cleantech 
group www.cleantech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Yoachim Haynes 
Consulting 
Manager 

Cleantech 
Group www.cleantech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



Stephen Marcus 

Director of 
Business 
Developmen
t 

Cleantech 
Group www.cleantech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Nisa Mirza Analyst 
Cleantech 
Group www.cleantech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Chris Sworder 
Senior 
Associate 

Cleantech 
Group  

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Alexand
ra Zakreski 

Client 
Account 
Manager, 
Europe and 
Asia 

Cleantech 
Group cleantech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Natalie Cox 
Event 
Coordinator 

Cleantech 
Group  USA 

At Cleantech Group, we 
provide research, 
consulting and events to 
catalyze opportunities for 
sustainable growth 
powered by innovation. 
We bring clients access to 
the trends, companies 
and people shaping the 
future and the 
customized advice and 
support businesses need 
to engage external 
innovation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



Paul Ray Director 

Clearwell 
Technology 
Limited https://clearwelltechnology.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Clearwell Technology is 
developing Therm-X-
Mill® an in-situ tubing & 
casing removal process 
for end-of-life oil & gas 
wells. Eliminating the 
need to recover tubing 
out of the well during 
Well Plug & 
Abandonment. Affording 
large emissions & cost 
reduction from current 
rig based industrial 
practices. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

John Watt 

Advisory 
Board 
member 

Climate Tech 
capital 
Partners https://www.climatetechcapitalpartners.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Climate Tech Capital 
Partners is an 
experienced venture 
capital team focused on 
making late SEED/ Series 
A early-stage investments 
in UK climate technology 
companies. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

David O'Hare 
Director - 
Europe 

Clir 
Renewables www.clir.eco Canada 

By leveraging 200 GW of 
wind and solar data, 
advanced AI, and 
decades of technical 
expertise, Clir 
Renewables provides 
unparalleled insight into 
four aspects of asset 
performance: production, 
health, insurance and 
financing. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Ofer Shochet 
Co-founder 
and CEO 

Copprint 
Technologies 
Ltd www.copprint.com Israel 

Copprint conductive 
copper inks enable the 
additive manufacturing 
of electronic circuit 
boards.Conductive traces 
can be simply printed 
with high conductivity 
low costs and no toxic 
chemicals.This enables a 
new era of green 
manufacturing of 
electronics incl 
compostable RFIDs and 
low-cost PVs. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Caitlin Wale Manager Counteract counteract.net 
United 
Kingdom 

Early-stage carbon 
removal investor 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Xiaoyan Ma 
Managing 
Director 

Danu 
Robotics Ltd Danu Robotics Ltd 

United 
Kingdom 

Danu Robotics is a fast 
growing cleantech start-
up based in Edinburgh. 
Our technology will not 
only clean up the 
environment, eliminate 
landfill and accelerate 
the achievement of a 
circular economy, but 
also can help our 
customers to become a 
more profitable and 
sustainable business. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Laurent SCHMITT 
CEO Dcbel 
Europe Dcbel www.dcbel.energy France 

Laurent Schmitt has 
joined dcbel early 
January 2022 as CEO of 
Dcbel Europe. He has 
been working for the last 
25 years through the 
Automation, IT and 
Digitisation of the Power 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Industry with latest 
position as Secretary 
General of ENTSO-E and 
Head of the SmartGrid 
activities of GE. 

Eric Marty 
Managing 
Partner 

Demeter 
Investment 
Managers https://demeter-im.com/en/home/ France 

Demeter is a major player 
in venture capital and 
private equity for the 
ecological transition. We 
invest from €1m to €30m 
to support companies at 
all stages of their 
development: innovative 
startups high growth 
SMEs and infrastructure 
projects. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Olivier 
BORDELA
NNE Partner 

Demeter 
Investment 
Managers https://demeter-im.com/en/home/ France 

Demeter is a major player 
in venture capital and 
private equity for the 
ecological transition. We 
invest from €1m to €30m 
to support companies at 
all stages of their 
development: innovative 
startups high growth 
SMEs and infrastructure 
projects. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Andrew Jordan 

Business 
Developmen
t Manager 

Denchi 
Group https://denchigroup.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Denchi Group is an 
engineering and 
manufacturing business 
that specialises in high 
reliability battery 
systems. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

DANIEL 
NASCIME
NTO Principal 

EDP 
Ventures https://www.edpventures.vc Portugal 

Principal at EDP 
Ventures, Ventures 
Capital arm of EDP Group 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 



>250 
employees) 

Mich Hein 

CEO & 
Managing 
Director 

Electrochaea 
GmbH www.electrochaea.com Germany 

Electrochaea is 
commercializing its 
power-to-gas technology 
to replace fossil fuels 
byproviding a grid-scale 
renewable gas 
generation and energy 
storage solution. Our 
proprietaryprocess 
converts renewable 
electricity and CO2 into 
grid-quality renewable 
methane forstorage and 
distribution. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Peter Plesner 

Business 
Developmen
t Director 

Electrochaea 
GmbH www.electrochaea.com Germany 

Electrochaea is 
commercializing its 
power-to-gas technology 
to replace fossil fuels 
byproviding a grid-scale 
renewable gas 
generation and energy 
storage solution. Our 
proprietaryprocess 
converts renewable 
electricity and CO2 into 
grid-quality renewable 
methane forstorage and 
distribution. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Jo-Jo Hubbard CEO Electron Www.electron.net 
United 
Kingdom 

Electron is a trading 
platform for local energy 
and flexibility markets 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Andrew Jennings 

Director of 
Developmen
t 

Elexsys 
Energy  

United 
Kingdom 

eleXsys Energy is the 
developer of eleXsys, an 
advanced power 
electronics device that 
enables next-generation 
two-way smart grids and 
unlocks the full potential 
of electricity networks to 
integrate optimised 
distributed clean energy 
and battery storage by 
providing a range of grid 
support services. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Casper Peeters CEO E-magy www.e-magy.com 
Netherla
nds 

E-magy is an advanced 
materials company that 
makes nano-porous 
silicon for high-energy 
lithium-ion batteries. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Jean-
Marc Boumans CFO E-magy www.e-magy.com 

Netherla
nds 

E-magy is an advanced 
materials company that 
makes nano-porous 
silicon for high-energy 
lithium-ion batteries. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Matthe
w Finn 

Commercial 
Director EMEC www.emec.org.uk 

United 
Kingdom 

EMEC is the world’s first 
and leading facility for 
demonstrating and 
testing wave and tidal 
energy converters in the 
sea. We offer purpose-
built, open-sea testing 
facilities for prototype 
technologies. Today 
we’re also pioneering the 
development of a green 
hydrogen economy in 
Orkney. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



Fredric Petit Partner 

Emerald 
Technology 
Ventures www.emerald-ventures.com 

Switzerla
nd 

Emerald is a globally 
recognized venture 
capital firm building a 
sustainable future at the 
crossroads of industry 
and technology. Founded 
in 2000, it is a pioneer in 
open innovation, 
providing multi-national 
corporations with rich 
deal flow and insight in 
the sectors and markets 
of tomorrow. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Fabian 
Braunwald
er 

Investment 
Manager 

Emerald 
Technology 
Ventures https://www.emerald-ventures.com/ 

Switzerla
nd 

Emerald is a globally 
recognized venture 
capital firm building a 
sustainable future at the 
crossroads of industry 
and technology. Emerald 
has managed and advised 
assets of over €1 billion 
from its offices in Zurich 
Toronto and Singapore. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Mauro Cozzi 
CEO & Co-
Founder Emitwise emitwise.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Our mission is to help 
businesses respond to 
the climate emergency by 
accelerating the 
transition to a net-zero 
carbon world. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Itaru Shiraishi Investor 

Energy & 
Environment 
Investment https://ee-investment.jp/en/ Japan 

The only venture capital 
firm in Japan focused on 
the environment and 
energy sectors. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Paul Jordan 

Business 
Leader, 
Innovator 
Support & 
International 

Energy 
Systems 
Catapult https://es.catapult.org.uk/ 

United 
Kingdom 

ESC is an independent, 
not-for-profit centre of 
excellence helping UK 
businesses and 
consumers navigate the 
energy transition. Our 
incubator, Energy 
Launchpad, supports over 
50 SMEs p.a. taking a 
whole energy systems 
view to address 
innovation priorities, 
market barriers and 
secure investment. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Maggie McGinlay 
Chief 
Executive 

Energy 
Transition 
Zone Ltd https://etzltd.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

ETZ Ltd is the not-for-
profit company tasked 
with repositioning North 
East of Scotland as a 
globally recognised 
integrated energy cluster 
focussed on the delivery 
of net zero and 
developing a sustainable 
long-term international 
industry base that 
delivers sustainable jobs 
& growth for the region. 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Vincent Pichon 
Investment 
director 

Engie New 
Ventures Engie New Ventures France 

Engie New Ventures is 
the corporate VC arm of 
the ENGIE Group 
worldwide. We focus on 
Series A investments in 
the energy space : new 
gases (h2, biogas, syngas, 
efuels...), renewable 
energies (especially 
digialization softwares for 
design, development, 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



O&M..), district heating 
and cooling... 

Laurent Rambaud 
INVESTMEN
T DIRECTOR 

ENGIE NEW 
VENTURES https://www.engieventures.com/ France 

Founded in 2014, our 
fund is dedicated to 
making minority 
investment in 
development to 
expansion phase (Series 
A, Series B) in cleantech 
companies and 
technology startups 
driving the energy 
transition. Investment in 
technology startups 
completes existing 
activities and resources 
to spur innovation w 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Lucy Rands 
Investment 
Manager ETF Partners  

United 
Kingdom 

The Environmental 
Technologies Fund is a 
London based Climate 
tech firm, backing 
Europe's leading high 
growth start-ups with a 
focus on digital 
sustainability. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Jens Busse 
Investment 
Director 

Evonik 
Venture 
Capital 
GmbH Evonik Venture Capital GmbH Germany 

We invest in innovative 
technologies and 
disruptive business 
models in the fields of 
Nutrition & Care 
Specialty Additives and 
Smart Materials as well 
as enabling digital 
technologies. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Ibrahee
m Khan CEO 

Extract 
Energy www.extractenergy.com Canada 

Powered by our leading 
engineered materials and 
technologies, Extract 
Energy deploys smart 
materials to converts 
low-grade waste heat to 
carbon-free electricity at 
lower temperatures with 
a faster ROI than 
anything on the market. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Dirk 
DE 
BOEVER 

Head of 
Investments Finindus www.finindus.be Belgium 

Dirk is a seasoned VC 
investor managing 
Finindus' investment 
activities. Finindus 
supports the journey to 
maturity of early stage 
and growth companies 
with industrial 
technologies (materials 
sustainable 
manufacturing and 
industry 4.0). Finindus is 
backed by ArcelorMittal 
and the Flemish region. Investor 

Alexand
er 

Starchenk
o 

Managing 
Partner 

First 
Imagine! http://www.firstimagine.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

First Imagine! is a 
European based venture 
capital firm looking for 
investment opportunities 
in the energy transition 
sector all over Europe 
and Israel. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Pierre 
Vanderkel
en CEO Fluitec www.fluitec.com 

Netherla
nds 

Fluitec is the innovator to 
Measure Monitor 
Decontaminate and 
Extend industrial fluids; 
their technologies reduce 
waste streams and lower 
CO2 emissions while 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



providing rapid return on 
investments. Fluitec is B-
Corp and Solar Impulse 
certified. 

Heikki Koponen 

Manager, 
Market 
Analysis and 
Sourcing Fortum Oy www.fortum.com Finland 

Fortum is the 3rd largest 
producer of CO2-free 
energy in Europe. We are 
interested in investing in 
and partnering with 
innovative energy and 
climate tech companies. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Ines 
Bergmann
-Nolting 

Managing 
Director 

Future 
Energy 
Ventures www.fev.vc Germany 

Future Energy Ventures is 
a unique venture capital 
platform that brings 
together corporate 
partners and world-class 
start-ups to shape the 
future energy landscape. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Gillian MacAulay Gatekeeper 

Gabriel 
Investments 
Ltd www.gabriel-is.com 

United 
Kingdom 

At Gabriel, we aim to be 
the foremost early-stage 
angel investment 
syndicate in Scotland.    
We give ambitious young 
Scottish companies the 
power to shine on the 
global stage through seed 
funding, mentoring and 
support from our 
established board of 
angels and business 
experts. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Fraser 
Johnston-
Donne 

Vice 
Principal 

General 
Atlantic https://www.generalatlantic.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

General Atlantic was 
founded by an 
entrepreneur and 
philanthropist who built a 
global business. We aim 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 



to help our portfolio 
companies achieve the 
same success. 

Natasha Fowlie Principal 
General 
Atlantic https://www.generalatlantic.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

General Atlantic was 
founded by an 
entrepreneur and 
philanthropist who built a 
global business. We aim 
to help our portfolio 
companies achieve the 
same success. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Vincent Dubu Ambassador 
Generation 
Atomic https://www.generationatomic.org/ France 

Hi, I’m an ambassador at 
Generation Atomic. I am 
very pleased to attend 
the CleanTech forum in 
Edinburgh in order to 
promote nuclear energy 
and meet people from 
different economic areas. 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Megan Wood 

Trade 
Commission
er (Clean 
Technologies
) 

Government 
of Canada https://www.tradecommissioner.gc.ca/ 

United 
Kingdom 

The Canadian Trade 
Commissioner Service 
(TCS) provides strategic 
market information and 
market access solutions 
for Canadian companies 
looking to export, invest 
abroad, or develop 
innovation and R&D 
partnerships using our 
extensive networks. We 
also assist foreign 
companies investing in 
Canada. 

Governmen
t 

Charlie Blair MD Gravitricity www.gravitricity.com 
United 
Kingdom 

Developing long-life 
underground energy 
storage technology. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Surakat Kudehinbu 
Investment 
Executive 

Green Angel 
Syndicate www.greenangelsyndicate.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Green Angel Syndicate is 
one of the largest angel 
syndicates in the UK and 
the only one specialising 
in the fight against 
Climate Change. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

andrew smith 
Co Founder 
and partner 

Greenbacker
s Investment 
Capital Greenbackers Investment Capital 

United 
Kingdom 

Gaining market access & 
adoption for climate 
technologies leading to 
funding and investment 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Robert Hokin 
Managing 
Partner 

Greenbacker
s Investment 
Capital http://greenbackers.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Greenbackers is a 
Scottish-based venture 
capital firm focussed on 
climate tech (netzero, 
earthtech, oceantech, 
cleantech and all related 
subsectors) globally. Investor 

Geoff Carragher CEO HGP www.h2gp.co.uk 
United 
Kingdom 

HGP (Scotland) Ltd has 
developed a turnkey 
technology solution for 
the decarbonisation of 
carbon intensive 
industries to help achieve 
Net Zero targets. HGP’s 
novel solution uses 
existing proven “off the 
shelf” technology to 
capture CO2 and use this 
to create renewable fuel, 
reducing emissions and 
re 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Keith Masson 

Head of Net 
Zero 
Transition HIE  

United 
Kingdom 

Enterprise agency for the 
North of Scotland. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 



Cael Husband 

Trade 
Commission
er 

High 
Commission 
of Canada in 
the UK https://www.tradecommissioner.gc.ca/ 

United 
Kingdom 

The Canadian Trade 
Commissioner Service 
provides strategic market 
information and market 
access solutions for 
Canadian companies 
looking to export, invest 
abroad, or develop 
innovation and R&D 
partnerships using our 
extensive network 
abroad and across 
Canada. 

Governmen
t 

Harutak
e Kajita 

Innovation 
Specialst Idemitsu https://www.idemitsu.com/en/ 

Switzerla
nd 

Idemitsu is a major 
Japanese energy and 
materials corporation. 
Our petroleum-based 
core business must be 
driven in a sustainable 
direction and therefore 
your idea/help/discussion 
is of help and we look 
forward to talking to you! 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Jochen Schneider 

General 
Manager, 
Open 
Innovation 
(Europe) Idemitsu www.idemitsu.com Japan 

Idemitsu is a major 
Japanese energy and 
materials corporation. 
Our areas of interest are  
hydrogen/ammonia 
fuels/chemicals based on 
biomass PtL/PtG ren. 
energy 
generation/storage/distri
bution advanced 
materials for 
renewables/electronic 
materials/ space/mobility 
applications. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 



Motohir
o Suzuki 

President & 
CEO 

Idemitsu 
Americas https://www.idemitsu.com/en/ USA 

Idemitsu Americas 
Holdings Corporation 
(“IAH”) is 100% 
subsidiary of Idemitsu 
Kosan one of the leading 
energy suppliers based in 
Japan. IAH aims to create 
values by finding 
collaborative 
opportunities with 
entrepreneurial 
innovators. target areas: 
CCUS hydrogen/ammonia 
circular economy etc. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Kei Honda 

Senior 
Manager, 
Business 
Developmen
t 

Idemitsu 
Americas https://www.idemitsu.com/en/ USA 

Idemitsu Americas 
Holdings Corporation 
(“IAH”) is 100% 
subsidiary of Idemitsu 
Kosan one of the leading 
energy suppliers based in 
Japan. IAH aims to create 
values by finding 
collaborative 
opportunities with 
entrepreneurial 
innovators. target areas: 
CCUS hydrogen/ammonia 
circular economy etc. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Sherief Rahim Director 

Improved 
Corporate 
Finance https://improvedcf.com/ 

Netherla
nds 

IMPROVED is a leading 
international Corporate 
Finance firm for mid-
market cross-border 
transactions supporting 
industry-leading 
entrepreneurs and 
founders in the 
Technology, Energy 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



Transition, and Mobility 
(TEM) sectors. 

Manus Weber Director 

Improved 
Corporate 
Finance https://improvedcf.com/ 

Netherla
nds 

IMPROVED is a leading 
international Corporate 
Finance firm for mid-
market cross-border 
transactions supporting 
industry-leading 
entrepreneurs and 
founders in the 
Technology, Energy 
Transition, and Mobility 
(TEM) sectors. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Dominiq
ue Houde Partner 

Improved 
Corporate 
Finance www.improvedcf.com 

United 
Kingdom 

IMPROVED is a leading 
international Corporate 
Finance firm for mid-
market cross-border 
transactions supporting 
industry-leading 
entrepreneurs and 
founders in the 
Technology, Energy 
Transition, and Mobility 
(TEM) sectors. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Gareth Selby 
CTO, Co-
Founder 

Inclusive 
Energy Ltd www.inclusive.energy 

United 
Kingdom 

Inclusive Energy aims to 
disrupt the global energy 
access space. Our remote 
monitoring and analytics 
solutions for solar and 
biogas are already 
working in 17 countries, 
and provide the digital 
bridge between off-grid 
energy providers, end-

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



users and carbon 
markets. 

Matias Torrellas 
Portfolio 
Manager InnoEnergy www.innoenergy.com Spain 

Early stage investor in 
sustainable energy start-
ups mainly in Europe and 
will a small but growing 
presence in the USA. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Jon Suarez 

Head of 
Access to 
Finance Innoenergy https://www.innoenergy.com/ 

Netherla
nds 

At EIT InnoEnergy, 
sustainability is about 
more than lowering 
emissions. True 
sustainability also means 
an industry that’s 
commercially viable, 
endlessly innovative, and 
highly competitive. We 
make this possible by 
supporting sustainable 
energy innovations which 
provide industry with risk 
free, pion 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Freerk Bisschop 
Venture 
Partner 

INVEN 
Capital https://www.invencapital.cz 

Netherla
nds 

At INVEN we help 
cleantech & energy 
startups. We seek out 
chemistry between 
inspirational founders 
management team and 
investors who are looking 
to change the world. We 
look for innovative and 
fast growing European 
and Israeli startups with 
scalable business models 
proven by sales. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Kristyna Machova 
Investment 
Manager Inven Capital www.invencapital.cz 

Czech 
Republic 

Inven Capital is a VC fund 
with EUR 0.5bn AUM 
investing into growth 
stage European and 
Israeli startups in the 
area of cleantech and 
decarbonisation. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Sam Cassidy 

Inward 
Investment 
Manager 

Invest 
Newcastle https://investnewcastle.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Part 
of NewcastleGateshead I
nitiative Invest Newcastle 
drive and deliver 
economic growth in 
Newcastle and 
Gateshead. They secure 
capital investment work 
to attract new businesses 
and create jobs. They 
help businesses to locate 
expand and thrive 
through a bespoke range 
of services. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Andrew Symes 

Investment 
Manager, 
Technology IP Group Plc IP Group plc 

United 
Kingdom 

IP Group was set up with 
a mission to evolve great 
ideas, mainly from our 
partner universities, into 
world-changing 
businesses. We achieve 
this by systematically 
helping to create, build 
and support outstanding 
intellectual property-
based companies. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Jamie Vollbracht 
Cleantech, 
Partner IP Group Plc https://www.ipgroupplc.com/ 

United 
Kingdom 

IP Group was set up with 
a mission to evolve great 
ideas, mainly from our 
partner universities, into 
world-changing 
businesses. We achieve 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



this by systematically 
helping to create, build 
and support outstanding 
intellectual property-
based companies. 

JOHN MCNICOL DIRECTOR 
KELVIN 
CAPITAL WWW.KELVINCAPITAL.COM 

United 
Kingdom 

Ambitious Business 
Capital looking to partner 
with the best 
entrepreneurs. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Iñigo Echaniz 
Investment 
Director 

Klima Energy 
Transition 

https://www.alantra.com/what-we-do/alternative-asset-
management/energy-transition/ Spain 

https://www.alantra.com
/what-we-do/alternative-
asset-
management/energy-
transition/ 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Oliver Sweeney Investor Lightrock https://www.lightrock.com/ 
United 
Kingdom 

Lightrock is a global 
private equity platform 
that backs purpose-
driven entrepreneurs 
tackling the world’s 
biggest challenges. Since 
2009, Lightrock has 
invested in companies 
that pursue scalable and 
tech-driven business 
models around the key 
impact themes of people, 
planet, and productivity. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

James Morrish CFO 
LiNa Energy 
Ltd https://lina.energy/ 

United 
Kingdom 

LiNa Energy is 
commercialising is high 
performance solid state 
sodium batteries which 
are more sustainable, 
safer and lower cost than 
lithium ion. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

JAMIE LINDSAY 
Managing 
Director LIND Limited www.lindproducts.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Low carbon energy 
storage technologies. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-



up/scale-
up, SME) 

Declan Bryans CTO Lind Ltd  

United 
Kingdom 

Home energy storage 
units to decarbonise and 
stabilise electrical and 
heat energy demands. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Ludwig Goris 
Investment 
Director Ludwig Goris www.capricorn.be Belgium 

Capricorn Partners wants 
to create both financial 
return and strategic value 
for its clients by investing 
in innovative companies 
that have a positive 
impact on people and the 
planet. We offer a unique 
mix of technology and 
investment expertise, 
creating an ecosystem of 
capital and 
entrepreneurship. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Tyler 
HAMILTO
N 

Director of 
Cleantech MaRS MaRSDD.com Canada 

MaRS is the largest urban 
innovation hub in North 
America, working with 
more than 1,400 tech 
ventures across Canada. 
A non-profit based in 
Toronto, MaRS is also 
Canada's largest 
cleantech support 
organization, helping 
250+ high-growth 
ventures connect and 
work w/ investors, 
customers and partners. 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Sarah Petrie 
Innovation 
Director 

Michelin 
Scotland 
Innovation 
Parc Michelin Scotland Innovation Parc 

United 
Kingdom 

Providing a dynamic and 
creative home for 
innovators 
manufacturers and skills 
leaders to collaborate 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 



and nurture growth and 
advances in sustainable 
mobility and 
decarbonisation. 

Colin Arnold 

Business 
Developmen
t Manager 

Michelin 
Scotland 
Innovation 
Parc Michelin Scotland Innovation Parc 

United 
Kingdom 

Building a dynamic and 
creative home for 
innovators 
manufacturers and skills 
leaders to collaborate 
and nurture growth and 
advances in sustainable 
mobility and 
decarbonisation. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Will Barker 
CEO and Co-
Founder 

Mint 
Innovation www.mint.bio 

New 
Zealand 

Recovering low-carbon 
metals such as gold 
lithium cobalt and copper 
from the urban mine 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Colum Rice 

Chief 
Financial 
Officer 

Mint 
Innovation www.mint.bio 

New 
Zealand 

Recovering low-carbon 
metals such as gold 
cobalt lithium and copper 
from the urban mine 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Camero
n McNatt 

Managing 
Director 

Mocean 
Energy www.mocean.energy 

United 
Kingdom 

Mocean Energy delivers 
renewable power from 
the oceans for a diversity 
of off-grid and on-grid 
users. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Quentin Scrimshire 
CEO and Co-
Founder 

Modo 
Energy https://modo.energy/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Quentin founded Modo 
Energy in 2019 to analyze 
the performance of 
battery energy storage 
assets. Modo is now used 
by over 80% of the GB 
energy storage market to 
monitor assets, 
operators, and 
optimizers. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Julian Klaiber 
Investment 
Associate 

Munich 
Venture 
Partners munichvp.com Germany 

Munich Venture Partners 
is a European VC investor 
backing entrepreneurs 
driving the eco-industrial 
revolution with 
transformative 
technologies. The 
investment focus is on 
sectors with CO2 
emission-intensive value 
chains: energy, mobility, 
agriculture and food, and 
industrial technologies. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Paul Saunders 

Senior 
Investment 
Director 

National 
Treasury 
Managemen
t Agency www.ntma.ie Ireland 

Ireland Strategic 
Investment Fund 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Nigel Purcell 

Senior 
Investment 
Manager 

National 
Treasury 
Managemen
t Agency www.ntma.ie Ireland 

Ireland Strategic 
Investment Fund 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Mark Anderson 
TechX 
Director 

Net Zero 
Technology 
Centre www.netzerotc.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Developing and 
deploying technology for 
an affordable net zero 
energy industry. 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Andrew Aldridge 
Senior 
Consultant NovAzure www.novazure.com 

United 
Kingdom 

NovAzure invests in and 
advises early stage 
cleantech ventures, 
providing hands-on 
support across strategy, 
routes to market and 
operational execution, to 
catalyse growth. We have 
an extensive network of 
corporate partners to 
leverage commercial 
partnerships, investment 
and licensing. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Jean-
Jacques Jouanna 

Managing 
Director NovAzure www.novazure.com 

United 
Kingdom 

I am the Managing 
Director of NovAzure. We 
leverage Innovation to 
help Startups, Corporate 
and Investors to 
accelerate their transition 
to NetZero in Energy & 
Mobility Investor 

Felicity O'Kelly 
Investment 
Associate 

OGCI 
Climate 
Investments www.ogci.com 

United 
Kingdom 

OGCI Climate 
Investments is a US$1B+ 
fund invests in 
technologies and projects 
that accelerate 
decarbonisation in 
sectors such as oil and 
gas industry and 
commercial transport. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Richard Searle 
Impact 
Analyst 

OGCI 
Climate 
Investments 
LLP OGCI Climate Investments LLP 

United 
Kingdom 

Impact Analyst at OGCI 
Climate Investments 
focusing n ESG analysis of 
potential investments. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Chris Milne CFO 

Orbital 
Marine 
Power www.orbitalmarine.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Innovative Scottish 
engineering company 
Orbital Marine Power is 
on a mission to help turn 
the tide on climate 
change by 
commercialising ground-
breaking technology that 
captures renewable 
energy from the power of 
the world’s tidal stream 
resources. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Andrew Scott CEO 

Orbital 
Marine 
Power www.orbitalmarine.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Innovative Scottish 
engineering company 
Orbital Marine Power is 
on a mission to help turn 
the tide on climate 
change by 
commercialising ground-
breaking technology that 
captures renewable 
energy from the power of 
the world’s tidal stream 
resources. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Michael Skirzynski 

Director, 
Strategy & 
Corporate 
Developmen
t 

Peak Power 
Inc. www.peakpowerenergy.com Canada 

Peak Power is a Canadian 
clean technology 
company. We are driving 
decarbonization by 
targeting the dirtiest and 
most expensive hours of 
energy use. We 
transform buildings, 
batteries, and electric 
vehicles into virtual 
power plants. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

David Amos 
Managing 
Director PlusZero Ltd www.pluszero.energy 

United 
Kingdom 

PlusZero is a Scottish 
startup with a mission to 
bring you carbon free 
portable power wherever 
you need it. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Doug 
Millington
-Smith 

Applications 
Manager 

QLM 
Technology 
Ltd www.qlmtec.com 

United 
Kingdom 

QLM enables 
organisations to achieve 
Net Zero through 
mitigation of methane 
emissions. Our quantum 
technology provides a 
true understanding of 
methane and other 
greennouse gas 
emissions, using cameras 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



that continuously, 
autonomously visualise 
and quantify gas plumes 
affordably at the facility 
scale. 

Sandra 
Blazquez 
Borras 

Sr. 
Investment 
Associate Repsol www.repsol.com Spain 

Repsol Corporate 
Venturing is a strategic 
fund focused on seeking 
solutions to business 
challenges by investing in 
disruptive technologies 
and new business models 
complement Repsol's 
internal capabilities 
fostering 
entrepreneurship 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Carlos 
González 
Guil 

Sr 
Investment 
Associate REPSOL www.repsol.com Spain 

Repsol Corporate 
Venturing is a strategic 
fund focused on seeking 
solutions to business 
challenges by investing in 
disruptive technologies 
and new business models 
complement Repsol's 
internal capabilities 
fostering 
entrepreneurship 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Henrik Olsen Co-Founder 
Rethinking 
Capital  

United 
Kingdom 

Investing for a 
sustainable future in an 
exponential world - 
collaboration with 
RethinkX. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Tim Longstaff Partner 
Roland 
Berger Ltd www.rolandberger.com 

United 
Kingdom Consulting 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 



>250 
employees) 

Ernst 
van 
Orsouw CEO 

Roslin 
Technologies www.roslintech.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Roslin Technologies is an 
Edinburgh-based biotech 
company focused on 
supplying animal stem 
cells to cultivated meat 
producers globally 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Richard Riggs 
Corporate 
venture 

SAEV Europe 
ltd SAEV Europe ltd 

United 
Kingdom 

Saudi Aramco Energy 
Ventures (SAEV) is the 
strategic technology 
venturing program of 
Saudi Aramco, the 
world’s leading 
integrated energy and 
chemicals company. Our 
mission is ‘to invest 
globally into start-up and 
high growth companies 
with technologies of 
strategic importance to 
Aramco. Investor 

Claude-
Sébastie
n Lerbourg 

External 
ventures 
manager, 
Europe Saint-Gobain  France 

Saint-Gobain is a 
worldwide leader in light 
and sustainable 
construction. Through 
NOVA a CVC structure 
Saint-Gobain plays an 
active role within the 
global start-up 
ecosystem. NOVA’s aim is 
to set up strategic 
partnerships and acquire 
equity stakes in start-ups 
to strengthen the 
relationship. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 



Arindam 
Bhattacha
rya 

Managing 
Director, 
Schlumberge
r Ventures 

Schlumberge
r www.slb.com USA 

Energy technology leader 
focused on New Energy 
and Cleantech spaces, 
with a strong strategic 
mandate and flexible 
investment thesis, 
supporting portfolio 
companies with 
technology 
industrialization and 
scaleup expertise 
leveraging an unmatched 
global footprint. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Debashi
s Gupta 

Venture 
Principal 

Schlumberge
r www.slb.com USA 

Schlumberger is global 
technology company 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Marc Strathie 

Head of 
Research 
and Policy ScotlandIS  

United 
Kingdom 

ScotlandIS is the 
membership and cluster 
organisation for the 
digital technologies 
industry in Scotland, 
representing over 1000 
companies through our 
cluster ecosystem, with 
more than 300 within our 
core membership. We 
are at the heart of 
Scotland’s digital 
economy. 

Non-profit / 
NGO 

Louise Innes 
Project 
Manager 

Scottish 
Developmen
t 
International https://www.sdi.co.uk/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Development 
International has more 
than 30 offices around 
the world with our staff 
ready to help you set up 
and grow your business 
in Scotland. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 



Victoria Ross 

Project 
Origination 
Manager 

Scottish 
Developmen
t 
International  

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Development 
International is the 
international arm of 
Scottish Enterprise. We 
support the building of 
partnerships and 
collaborations and our 
connections provide a 
powerful business 
network. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Craig Waterson 
Investment 
Manager 

Scottish 
Enterprise 

https://www.scottish-enterprise.com/support-for-
businesses/funding-and-grants/accessing-finance-and-
attracting-investment 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Enterprise is 
Scotland's national 
economic development 
agency. We’re committed 
to growing the Scottish 
economy for the benefit 
of all, helping create 
more quality jobs and a 
brighter future for every 
region. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Suzanne Sosna 

Director of 
Economic 
Opportunitie
s & Climate 

Scottish 
Enterprise www.scottish-enterprise.com Scotland 

Scottish Enterprise is a 
non-departmental public 
body of the Scottish 
Government which 
encourages economic 
development, enterprise, 
innovation and 
investment in business. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Maria McKinney 
Business 
Partner 

Scottish 
Enterprise www.scottish-enterprise.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Enterprise is 
Scotland's national 
economic development 
agency. We’re committed 
to growing the Scottish 
economy for the benefit 
of all helping create more 
quality jobs and a 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 



brighter future for every 
region. 

Michelle Kinnaird 

Head of 
Investment 
Managemen
t 

Scottish 
Enterprise www.scottish-enterprise.com 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Enterprise is 
Scotland's national 
economic development 
agency 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Michelle Howell 

Head of 
Investment 
Managemen
t 

Scottish 
Enterprise Scottish Enterprise 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Enterprise is 
Scotland's national 
economic development 
agency.  We're 
committed to growing 
the Scottish economy for 
the benefit of all helping 
create more quality jobs 
and a brighter future for 
every region. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Morag Clark Specialist 
scottish 
enterprise scottish enterprise 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Enterprise is a 
non-departmental public 
body of the Scottish 
Government which 
encourages economic 
development enterprise 
innovation and 
investment in business 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 

Eddie 
McAvinch
ey 

Executive 
Director - 
Sustainable 
Investment 

Scottish 
National 
Investment 
Bank www.thebank.scot 

United 
Kingdom 

The Bank was launched in 
November 2020 to be a 
development investment 
bank for Scotland, 
delivering patient, 
mission impact 
investment to the 
Scottish economy. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Mark Munro 

Executive 
Director - 
Sustainable 

Scottish 
National Scottish National Investment Bank 

United 
Kingdom 

Net Zero Mission Lead at 
the Scottish National 
Investment Bank. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



Developmen
t 

Investment 
Bank 

James 
Williamso
n 

Executive 
Director - 
Sustainable 
Investment 

Scottish 
National 
Investment 
Bank Scottish National Investment Bank 

United 
Kingdom 

National development 
bank for Scotland 
providing impact-led 
patient capital 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Kyle Mathieson 
Project 
Coordinator 

Scottish 
Water https://www.scottishwaterhorizons.co.uk/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Water Horizons 
is a commercial 
subsidiary wholly owned 
by Scottish Water.  The 
company plays a key role 
in supporting the 
development of 
Scotland’s sustainable 
economy. We support 
innovation in the water 
sector through our 
Development Centres 
where we help 
innovators test their 
innovations. 

Governmen
t 

Kerry Simcock 
Project 
Manager 

Scottish 
Water 
Horizons https://www.scottishwaterhorizons.co.uk/ 

United 
Kingdom 

Scottish Water Horizons 
is a commercial 
subsidiary wholly owned 
by Scottish Water.  The 
company plays a key role 
in supporting the 
development of 
Scotland’s sustainable 
economy. We support 
innovation in the water 
sector through our 
Development Centres 
where we innovators can 
test their innovations. 

Governmen
t 



Wouter Jonk 
Managing 
Partner SET Ventures www.SETVentures.com 

Netherla
nds 

SET Ventures Since 2007 
Amsterdam-based SET 
Ventures invests in 
European technology 
companies that positively 
impact the energy system 
transition. SET Ventures 
focus on exceptional 
teams that address the 
climate crisis through 
digital technologies and 
disruptive business 
models. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Benedik
t Stolz 

Equity 
Manager 

Siemens 
Financial 
Services 

https://new.siemens.com/global/en/company/about/busi
nesses/financial-services.html Germany 

Siemens Financial 
Services is the investing 
arm of Siemens. The 
equity business is a well 
established and 
experienced 
infrastructure investor 
with a successful track 
record in project finance, 
infrastructure platform 
and fund investments. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Faisal Ghani 
CEO and 
Founder SolarisKit Ltd https://solariskit.com 

United 
Kingdom 

SolarisKit has developed 
the world's first flat-
packable, self-assembled 
solar thermal collector. A 
device which is able to 
convert sunlight directly 
into hot water. It has 
been developed to 
unlock the potential of 
solar energy to 
decarbonise heat in both 
developing and 
industrialised nations. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Lucy Kennedy CEO Spottitt Ltd. www.spottitt.com 
United 
Kingdom 

Spottitt helps utilities 
increase the reliability 
and efficiency of their 
transmission and 
distribution services, by 
providing effective and 
scalable satellite derived 
inspections to monitor 
more than 20 risks fully 
remotely. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Gavin Park CEO StorTera Ltd https://www.stortera.com/ 
United 
Kingdom 

StorTera are an 
innovative energy 
storage solutions 
provider who are 
developing the next 
generation of battery 
technology 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Josh Gilbert 
CEO & Co-
Founder Sust Global www.sustglobal.com USA 

Satellite-validated 
climate data via scalable 
API integrations 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Mikael Fjällström 

Senior 
Business 
Developer 

Swedish 
Energy 
Agency www.energimyndigheten.se Sweden 

National authority for 
energy policy issuesSorts 
under Ministry of the 
infrastructureGovernmen
t fundedAround 460 
employees16 billion SEK 
a year for efforts in 
research development 
and business 
development 

Governmen
t 

Nicolas De Witt Partner 
Taylor 
Wessing  France 

Taylor Wessing is a global 
law firm. With more than 
1000 lawyers in 29 offices 
in 17 different 
jurisdictions Taylor 
Wessing is a truly 
international law firm Academic 



exceptionally placed to 
serve clients across the 
world’s most dynamic 
economies 

Howard Palmer Partner 
Taylor 
Wessing LLP Taylor Wessing LLP 

United 
Kingdom 

Partner in the corporate 
technology team advising 
on venture capital 
investments, particularly 
within the cleantech and 
fintech sectors 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Peter Hellich Partner 

Taylor 
Wessing 
PartG mbB https://www.taylorwessing.com/en Germany 

Our venture capital team 
is recognised as one of 
the strongest in Europe, 
advising our clients 
across all stages of their 
lifecycle from "cradle to 
liquidity". Our 
international offering 
includes many of the 
major tech hubs, such as 
Silicon Valley, London, 
Berlin, Paris and 
Amsterdam. 

Service 
Provider 

Hao Yin CEO 
TEGnology 
ApS www.TEGnology.dk Denmark 

TEGnology converts heat 
into electricity to supply 
power to wireless sensors 
so that the sensors are 
truly autonomous and 
wireless. We have unique 
advantages in handling 
novel materials and 
producing them in large 
scale. 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 



Dominic Tantram Partner 
Terrafiniti 
LLP www.terrafiniti.com 

United 
Kingdom 

A specialist international 
sustainability consultancy 
with an outstanding track 
record in innovation and 
developing best 
practices, Terrafiniti 
helps companies navigate 
the complexities of 
sustainability to deliver 
ambitious results. 

Service 
Provider / 
Professional 
Services 

Olivier Pernet 

TotalEnergie
s Ventures 
Manager 

TotalEnergie
s TotalEnergies France 

Manager at TotalEnergies 
Ventures 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

David Millar 

Snr 
Innovation 
Fellow 

University of 
Stirling 

https://www.stir.ac.uk/about/scotlands-international-
environment-centre/hydro-nation/ 

United 
Kingdom 

The Scotland Hydro 
Nation Chair, hosted by 
the University of Stirling, 
is collaborating across 
academia and industry to 
deliver research, 
technology and 
innovation programmes 
that will enable Scottish 
Water to deliver its 2040 
Net Zero ambitions. Academic 

Tim Hurst 
Managing 
Director 

Wave Energy 
Scotland www.waveenergyscotland.co.uk 

United 
Kingdom 

Public body that funds 
the development of 
innovative wave energy 
technology with the aim 
of developing cost 
competitive wave energy 
technology that can assist 
Scotland to achieve its 
2045 emissions targets 
and export technology 
into a global market. 

Economic 
Developme
nt Agency 



Dr. 
Carsten Brueckner 

Senior 
Investment 
Manager 

Wintershall 
Dea 
Technology 
Ventures 
GmbH www.wintershalldea.ventures Germany 

Wintershall Dea 
Technology Ventures is 
the Corporate Venture 
Capital unit of 
Wintershall Dea the 
leading independent 
European gas and oil 
company. We invest in 
startups that can create 
value for our core 
business including 
hydrogen and carbon 
management. 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Craig Douglas 
Founding 
Partner World Fund www.worldfund.vc 

Netherla
nds 

Europe's largest Climate 
tech VC 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 

Simon 
Hombersl
ey CEO Xampla www.xampla.com 

United 
Kingdom 

CEO of Xampla, making 
replacements for single-
use plastics and 
microplastics from 
natural polymers 

Entreprene
urial (Start-
up/scale-
up, SME) 

Pierre De Vuyst 
Executive 
Advisor 

YOKOGAWA 
Middle East 
and Africa https://www.yokogawa.com/ Japan 

Yokogawa is a Process 
Automation Solutions 
Provider. To help 
customers drive costs 
down and eliminate 
emissions the company 
provides “Smart 
Manufacturing Solutions” 
and drives the IA2IA 
(Industrial Automation to 
Industrial Autonomy) 
concept. IA2IA allows 
factories to be 
completely autonomous. 

Corporation 
(large multi-
national, 
>250 
employees) 

Pippa Gawley Director 
Zero Carbon 
Capital zerocarbon.capital 

United 
Kingdom 

We back extraordinary 
companies building 
innovative, scientific 

Investor 
(VC, CVC, 
angel) 



solutions to the biggest, 
hardest challenges of 
decarbonisation. 

 

 


